

Line #	AWARD				AWARD				AWARD				AWARD				AWARD			
	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel				Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc		D & L SAND & GRAVEL LLC		DeWeese Sand & Gravel		Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand & Gravel		HOOKER BROTHERS SAND & GRAVEL INC					
	Description	Qty	UOM		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price				
1	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL GREENWOOD YARD	715	TN		\$ 18.15	\$ 12,977.25														
2	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY S12D DWIGHT	1,500	TN		No Bid															
3	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY JCT 79 AND 34	2,250	TN		No Bid															
4	DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL HWY JCT 8 AND 65	500	TN		\$ 23.15	\$ 11,575.00														
5	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE	2,500	TN		No Bid															
6	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON	2,500	TN		No Bid															
7	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 51 AND 77	1,500	TN		No Bid															
8	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 32 AND 275	500	TN		No Bid															
9	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL FULLERTON MAINT YARD	500	TN		No Bid															
10	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ORD MAINT YARD	500	TN		No Bid															
11	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL GREELEY YARD	300	TN		No Bid															
12	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ST PAUL MAINT YARD	1,000	TN		No Bid					\$ 10.00	\$ 10,000.00			\$ 9.70	\$ 9,700.00					
13	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	600	TN		No Bid															
14	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,000	TN		No Bid					\$ 9.34	\$ 9,340.00			\$ 8.90	\$ 8,900.00					
15	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL JCT81 AND 92 3 MI W OF OSCEOLA	850	TN		No Bid															
16	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP339 2MI W OF FARWELL	500	TN		No Bid															
17	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA	500	TN		No Bid															
18	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	500	TN		No Bid					\$ 15.50	\$ 7,750.00			\$ 15.75	\$ 7,875.00					
19	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD	600	TN		No Bid					\$ 19.75	\$ 11,850.00			\$ 20.58	\$ 12,348.00					
20	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD	1,000	TN		No Bid					\$ 19.75	\$ 19,750.00			\$ 23.05	\$ 23,050.00					
21	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL	1,200	TN		No Bid									\$ 14.15	\$ 16,980.00					
22	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	2,000	TN		No Bid															
23	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	400	TN		\$ 17.15	\$ 6,860.00				\$ 9.93	\$ 3,972.00			\$ 10.19	\$ 4,076.00					
24	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD	1,420	TN		\$ 17.65	\$ 25,063.00				\$ 13.89	\$ 19,723.80			\$ 14.15	\$ 20,093.00					
25	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA	2,000	TN		No Bid															
26	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY14 MP106 7 MI N OF FULLERTO	100	TN		No Bid															
27	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD	700	TN		No Bid															

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc		D & L SAND & GRAVEL LLC		DeWeese Sand & Gravel		Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand & Gravel		HOOKER BROTHERS SAND & GRAVEL INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
28	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP68 5MI S OF ORD	1,400	TN	No Bid											
29	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP95 1 MI N OF ST PAUL	700	TN	No Bid						\$ 10.17	\$ 7,119.00			\$ 9.60	\$ 6,720.00
30	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP89 5 MI S OF ST PAUL	700	TN	No Bid						\$ 9.42	\$ 6,594.00			\$ 8.78	\$ 6,146.00
31	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	No Bid											
32	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP125 7 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	No Bid											
33	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP129 10 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	No Bid											
34	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY58 MP29 1 MI N OF ROCKVILLE	1,280	TN	No Bid								\$ 18.50	\$ 23,680.00		
35	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP320 1 MI W OF LOUP CIT	640	TN	No Bid											
36	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GERING MAINT YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
37	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL BRIDGPORT YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
38	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CHAPPELL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid											
39	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL KIMBALL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid											
40	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL SIDNEY MAINT YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid											
41	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY20 MP 25 10MI W OF CRAWFORD	2,000	TN	No Bid											
42	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISON YARD	3,000	TN	No Bid											
43	DIST 5 ARMOR COATGRAVEL HWY29 MP59 9MI S OF HARRISON	4,000	TN	No Bid											
44	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL	2,000	TN	No Bid											
45	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY250 MP39 9MI S OF RUSHVILLE	2,000	TN	No Bid											
46	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF SCOTTSBLU	3,000	TN	No Bid											
47	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP41 JCT26 AND L62A	2,000	TN	No Bid											
48	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY88 MP17 13MI S OF GERING	3,000	TN	No Bid											
49	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY	2,000	TN	No Bid											
50	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISBURG YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid											
51	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL	4,000	TN	No Bid											
52	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY87 MP16 16 MI N OF ALLIANCE	4,000	TN	No Bid											
53	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP9 12MI NW OF NORTH PLA	2,000	TN	No Bid											

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc		D & L SAND & GRAVEL LLC		DeWeese Sand & Gravel		Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand & Gravel		HOOKER BROTHERS SAND & GRAVEL INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
54	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 23 MP 56 DICKENS	2,000	TN	No Bid											
55	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS	2,500	TN	No Bid											
56	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
57	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
58	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
59	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	750	TN	No Bid											
60	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	500	TN	No Bid											
61	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY MAINT YARD	1,500	TN	No Bid											
62	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SARGENT YARD	750	TN	No Bid											
63	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO MAINT YARD	1,500	TN	No Bid											
64	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OCONTO JCT HWY 21AND 40	7,500	TN	No Bid											
65	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	375	TN	No Bid											
66	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	1,500	TN	No Bid											
67	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257	750	TN	No Bid											
68	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68	750	TN	No Bid											
69	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	1,500	TN	No Bid											
70	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	500	TN	No Bid											
71	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 AT DUNNING	750	TN	No Bid											
72	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ROSCOE HWY30 MP136	2,500	TN	No Bid											
73	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OGALLALA HWY26 MP136	2,500	TN	No Bid											
74	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS	5,000	TN	No Bid											
75	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 30 AT OVERTON	1,500	TN	No Bid											
76	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,500	TN	No Bid											
77	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,000	TN	No Bid											
78	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	500	TN	No Bid											
79	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	2,000	TN	No Bid											
80	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	1,500	TN	No Bid											

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc		D & L SAND & GRAVEL LLC		DeWeese Sand & Gravel		Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand & Gravel		HOOKER BROTHERS SAND & GRAVEL INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
81	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS	1,000	TN	No Bid											
82	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON	1,000	TN	No Bid											
83	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON	1,500	TN	No Bid											
84	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	500	TN	No Bid											
85	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	1,500	TN	No Bid											
86	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN	1,000	TN	No Bid											
87	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN	No Bid											
88	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR	1,000	TN	No Bid											
89	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN	No Bid											
90	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL THEDFORD YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
91	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY	1,000	TN	No Bid											
92	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL	1,000	TN	No Bid											
93	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN	850	TN	No Bid											
94	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP58 9MI S OF GRANT	2,200	TN	No Bid											
95	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY23 MP14 5MI W OF GRANT	600	TN	No Bid											
96	DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS	680	TN	No Bid						\$ 10.48	\$ 7,126.40				
97	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	800	TN	No Bid		\$ 14.52	\$ 11,616.00								
98	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL AINSWORTH YARD	1,500	TN	No Bid		\$ 9.89	\$ 14,835.00	\$ 9.95	\$ 14,925.00						
99	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL VALENTINE YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 12.40	\$ 24,800.00						
100	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL CODY YARD	500	TN	No Bid		\$ 24.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 17.75	\$ 8,875.00						
101	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL MERRIMAN YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid		\$ 29.48	\$ 58,960.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 58,000.00						
102	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL NAPER YARD	500	TN	No Bid		\$ 11.60	\$ 5,800.00								
103	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPENCER YARD	500	TN	No Bid		\$ 10.20	\$ 5,100.00								
104	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BURWELL SOUTH YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid		\$ 18.00	\$ 18,000.00								
105	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BARTLETT YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid											
106	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL TAYLOR YARD	2,000	TN	No Bid											

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Atkinson Sand & Gravel Inc		D & L SAND & GRAVEL LLC		DeWeese Sand & Gravel		Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand & Gravel		HOOKER BROTHERS SAND & GRAVEL INC		
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
107	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL O'NEILL YARD	500	TN	No Bid		\$ 8.74	\$ 4,370.00									
108	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	1,000	TN	No Bid		\$ 18.08	\$ 18,080.00									
109	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER	2,000	TN	No Bid												
110	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON	500	TN	No Bid		\$ 9.47	\$ 4,735.00									
111	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281	1,500	TN	No Bid												
112	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A	4,000	TN	No Bid												
113	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP36	3,500	TN	No Bid												
114	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP43	2,500	TN	No Bid												
115	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG	600	TN	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 7,080.00									
116	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN	1,200	TN	No Bid		\$ 29.50	\$ 35,400.00	\$ 20.60	\$ 24,720.00							
117	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY	600	TN	No Bid		\$ 26.25	\$ 15,750.00	\$ 16.94	\$ 10,164.00							
118	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS	600	TN	No Bid		\$ 19.62	\$ 11,772.00	\$ 16.70	\$ 10,020.00							
119	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE	1,200	TN	No Bid		\$ 19.79	\$ 23,748.00	\$ 12.10	\$ 14,520.00							
120	OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	No Bid		\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00									
121	OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	No Bid		\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00	.15 C TON Mile								
122	OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	No Bid				.15 C TON Mile			.20/Ton/Mi le	\$ 40.00				
123	OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	No Bid												
124	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS	5,000	TN	No Bid												
Total					\$ 76.10	\$ 56,475.25	\$ 281.24	\$ 287,306.00	\$135.74	\$ 166,084.00	\$ 128.23	\$ 103,225.20	\$ 18.20	\$ 23,720.00	\$ 134.85	\$ 115,888.00
Payment Terms					0-30		Net-30		100-30		Net-45		100-30			
Delivery Days ARO					14				15		10		45			15
Comments																

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.

No Bids
K4 Trucking

Tie Breaker
Line 20
DeWeese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Wins Tie Breaker
Island Landhandlers

Invalid Bids
Matteo Sand & Gravel

Line 99
D & L Sand & Gravel LLC-Wins Tie Breaker
Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			AWARD		AWARD		L.G. Everist, Inc		AWARD		AWARD		AWARD	
				Island Landhandlers		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,		Unit Price	Extended Price	L & L Gravel		Lyman Richey Corporation		Marxsen Sand & Gravel	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
1	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL GREENWOOD YARD	715	TN												
2	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY S12D DWIGHT	1,500	TN												
3	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY JCT 79 AND 34	2,250	TN												
4	DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL HWY JCT 8 AND 65	500	TN												
5	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE	2,500	TN									\$ 15.46	\$ 38,650.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 35,000.00
6	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON	2,500	TN			\$ 21.50	\$ 53,750.00					\$ 19.74	\$ 49,350.00		
7	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 51 AND 77	1,500	TN												
8	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 32 AND 275	500	TN												
9	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL FULLERTON MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 14.55	\$ 7,275.00							\$ 15.42	\$ 7,710.00		
10	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ORD MAINT YARD	500	TN			\$ 10.43	\$ 5,215.00								
11	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL GREELEY YARD	300	TN			\$ 13.36	\$ 4,008.00								
12	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ST PAUL MAINT YARD	1,000	TN	\$ 10.20	\$ 10,200.00										
13	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	600	TN			\$ 12.65	\$ 7,590.00								
14	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,000	TN	\$ 9.55	\$ 9,550.00										
15	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL JCT81 AND 92 3 MI W OF OSCEOLA	850	TN									\$ 14.73	\$ 12,520.50		
16	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP339 2MI W OF FARWELL	500	TN	\$ 17.30	\$ 8,650.00	\$ 15.25	\$ 7,625.00								
17	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA	500	TN			\$ 13.75	\$ 6,875.00								
18	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	500	TN	\$ 15.85	\$ 7,925.00										
19	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD	600	TN	\$ 19.25	\$ 11,550.00										
20	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD	1,000	TN	\$ 19.75	\$ 19,750.00										
21	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL	1,200	TN	\$ 15.85	\$ 19,020.00										
22	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 16.25	\$ 32,500.00								
23	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	400	TN												
24	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD	1,420	TN												
25	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA	2,000	TN									\$ 9.86	\$ 19,720.00		
26	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY14 MP106 7 MI N OF FULLERTO	100	TN									\$ 13.01	\$ 1,301.00		
27	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD	700	TN			\$ 10.85	\$ 7,595.00								

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Island Landhandlers		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,		L.G. Everist, Inc		L & L Gravel		Lyman Richey Corporation		Marxsen Sand & Gravel	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
28	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP68 5MI S OF ORD	1,400	TN			\$ 11.10	\$ 15,540.00								
29	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP95 1 MI N OF ST PAUL	700	TN									\$ 10.20	\$ 7,140.00		
30	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP89 5 MI S OF ST PAUL	700	TN									\$ 9.36	\$ 6,552.00		
31	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN			\$ 12.85	\$ 15,420.00								
32	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP125 7 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN			\$ 11.75	\$ 14,100.00								
33	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP129 10 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN			\$ 11.30	\$ 13,560.00								
34	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY58 MP29 1 MI N OF ROCKVILLE	1,280	TN			\$ 12.60	\$ 16,128.00								
35	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP320 1 MI W OF LOUP CIT	640	TN			\$ 12.75	\$ 8,160.00								
36	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GERING MAINT YARD	1,000	TN												
37	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL BRIDGPORT YARD	1,000	TN												
38	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CHAPPELL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN												
39	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL KIMBALL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN												
40	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL SIDNEY MAINT YARD	2,000	TN												
41	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY20 MP 25 10MI W OF CRAWFORD	2,000	TN												
42	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISON YARD	3,000	TN												
43	DIST 5 ARMOR COATGRAVEL HWY29 MP59 9MI S OF HARRISON	4,000	TN												
44	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL	2,000	TN												
45	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY250 MP39 9MI S OF RUSHVILLE	2,000	TN			\$ 32.15	\$ 64,300.00								
46	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF SCOTTSBLU	3,000	TN												
47	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP41 JCT26 AND L62A	2,000	TN												
48	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY88 MP17 13MI S OF GERING	3,000	TN												
49	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY	2,000	TN												
50	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISBURG YARD	2,000	TN												
51	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL	4,000	TN												
52	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY87 MP16 16 MI N OF ALLIANCE	4,000	TN												
53	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP9 12MI NW OF NORTH PLA	2,000	TN												

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Island Landhandlers		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,		L.G. Everist, Inc		L & L Gravel		Lyman Richey Corporation		Marxsen Sand & Gravel	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
54	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 23 MP 56 DICKENS	2,000	TN												
55	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS	2,500	TN												
56	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD	1,000	TN												
57	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD	1,000	TN												
58	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD	1,000	TN												
59	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	750	TN			\$ 11.10	\$ 8,325.00								
60	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	500	TN			\$ 14.97	\$ 7,485.00								
61	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY MAINT YARD	1,500	TN			\$ 11.15	\$ 16,725.00								
62	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SARGENT YARD	750	TN			\$ 9.85	\$ 7,387.50								
63	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO MAINT YARD	1,500	TN												
64	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OCONTO JCT HWY 21AND 40	7,500	TN												
65	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	375	TN												
66	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	1,500	TN												
67	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257	750	TN			\$ 12.25	\$ 9,187.50								
68	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68	750	TN			\$ 13.50	\$ 10,125.00								
69	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	1,500	TN			\$ 13.00	\$ 19,500.00								
70	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	500	TN			\$ 15.80	\$ 7,900.00								
71	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 AT DUNNING	750	TN			\$ 8.89	\$ 6,667.50			\$ 15.15	\$ 11,362.50				
72	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ROSCOE HWY30 MP136	2,500	TN												
73	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OGALLALA HWY26 MP136	2,500	TN												
74	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS	5,000	TN												
75	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 30 AT OVERTON	1,500	TN												
76	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,500	TN			\$ 15.00	\$ 37,500.00			\$ 10.35	\$ 25,875.00				
77	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,000	TN			\$ 18.50	\$ 37,000.00			\$ 12.45	\$ 24,900.00				
78	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	500	TN			\$ 15.00	\$ 7,500.00			\$ 10.50	\$ 5,250.00				
79	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	2,000	TN												
80	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	1,500	TN												

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Island Landhandlers		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,		L.G. Everist, Inc		L & L Gravel		Lyman Richey Corporation		Marxsen Sand & Gravel	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
81	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS	1,000	TN			\$ 19.80	\$ 19,800.00			\$ 16.50	\$ 16,500.00				
82	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON	1,000	TN							\$ 10.73	\$ 10,730.00				
83	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON	1,500	TN							\$ 13.50	\$ 20,250.00				
84	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	500	TN												
85	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	1,500	TN												
86	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN	1,000	TN			\$ 16.45	\$ 16,450.00			\$ 11.64	\$ 11,640.00				
87	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN												
88	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR	1,000	TN												
89	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN												
90	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL THEDFORD YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 17.45	\$ 17,450.00			\$ 10.50	\$ 10,500.00				
91	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY	1,000	TN			\$ 16.15	\$ 16,150.00			\$ 13.05	\$ 13,050.00				
92	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL	1,000	TN												
93	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN	850	TN												
94	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP58 9MI S OF GRANT	2,200	TN												
95	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY23 MP14 5MI W OF GRANT	600	TN												
96	DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS	680	TN												
97	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	800	TN			\$ 11.45	\$ 9,160.00								
98	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL AINSWORTH YARD	1,500	TN			\$ 10.85	\$ 16,275.00								
99	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL VALENTINE YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 12.40	\$ 24,800.00								
100	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL CODY YARD	500	TN			\$ 17.95	\$ 8,975.00								
101	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL MERRIMAN YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 21.45	\$ 42,900.00								
102	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL NAPER YARD	500	TN			\$ 12.00	\$ 6,000.00								
103	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPENCER YARD	500	TN			\$ 13.00	\$ 6,500.00								
104	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BURWELL SOUTH YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 11.00	\$ 11,000.00								
105	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BARTLETT YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 10.23	\$ 10,230.00								
106	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL TAYLOR YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 11.00	\$ 22,000.00								

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Island Landhandlers		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc,		L.G. Everist, Inc		L & L Gravel		Lyman Richey Corporation		Marxsen Sand & Gravel	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
107	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL O'NEILL YARD	500	TN												
108	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 14.65	\$ 14,650.00								
109	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER	2,000	TN			\$ 17.00	\$ 34,000.00								
110	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON	500	TN			\$ 12.75	\$ 6,375.00								
111	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281	1,500	TN			\$ 13.89	\$ 20,835.00								
112	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A	4,000	TN			\$ 13.50	\$ 54,000.00								
113	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP36	3,500	TN			\$ 15.80	\$ 55,300.00								
114	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP43	2,500	TN			\$ 14.75	\$ 36,875.00								
115	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG	600	TN			\$ 10.75	\$ 6,450.00								
116	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN	1,200	TN			\$ 24.25	\$ 29,100.00								
117	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY	600	TN			\$ 18.50	\$ 11,100.00								
118	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS	600	TN			\$ 17.20	\$ 10,320.00								
119	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE	1,200	TN			\$ 14.00	\$ 16,800.00								
120	OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.18	\$ 36.00	\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00			0.16 Ton mile	\$ 32.00			\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00
121	OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.18	\$ 36.00	\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00			.16 Ton Mile	\$ 32.00				
122	OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN			\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00			.16 Ton Mile	\$ 32.00				
123	OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN			\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00			.16 Ton Mile	\$ 32.00				
124	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS	5,000	TN					\$37.35	\$ 186,750.00						
Total				\$122.66	\$ 93,992.00	\$ 766.37	\$ 971,283.50	\$37.35	\$ 186,750.00	\$125.01	\$ 150,185.50	\$107.78	\$ 142,943.50	\$ 14.00	\$ 35,000.00
Payment Terms				30		Net-30		Net-30		100-30					
Delivery Days ARO				30		As required		45				45			
Comments															

**Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western
Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.**

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			AWARD		AWARD		AWARD		AWARD		AWARD		AWARD	
				Overton Sand & Gravel Co.		Paulsen Inc		Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc		Simon		STALP GRAVEL, INC.		Triple G Redimix LLC	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
	Description	Qty	UOM												
1	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL GREENWOOD YARD	715	TN												
2	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY S12D DWIGHT	1,500	TN												
3	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY JCT 79 AND 34	2,250	TN												
4	DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL HWY JCT 8 AND 65	500	TN												
5	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE	2,500	TN												
6	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON	2,500	TN												
7	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 51 AND 77	1,500	TN								\$ 18.00	\$ 27,000.00			
8	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 32 AND 275	500	TN								\$ 15.00	\$ 7,500.00			
9	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL FULLERTON MAINT YARD	500	TN												
10	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ORD MAINT YARD	500	TN												
11	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL GREELEY YARD	300	TN												
12	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ST PAUL MAINT YARD	1,000	TN												
13	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	600	TN												
14	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,000	TN												
15	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL JCT81 AND 92 3 MI W OF OSCEOLA	850	TN												
16	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP339 2MI W OF FARWELL	500	TN												
17	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA	500	TN												
18	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	500	TN												
19	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD	600	TN												
20	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD	1,000	TN												
21	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL	1,200	TN												
22	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	2,000	TN												
23	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	400	TN												
24	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD	1,420	TN												
25	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA	2,000	TN												
26	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY14 MP106 7 MI N OF FULLERTO	100	TN												
27	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD	700	TN												

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Overton Sand & Gravel Co.		Paulsen Inc		Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc		Simon		STALP GRAVEL, INC.		Triple G Redimix LLC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
28	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP68 5MI S OF ORD	1,400	TN												
29	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP95 1 MI N OF ST PAUL	700	TN												
30	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP89 5 MI S OF ST PAUL	700	TN												
31	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN												
32	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP125 7 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN												
33	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP129 10 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN												
34	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY58 MP29 1 MI N OF ROCKVILLE	1,280	TN												
35	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP320 1 MI W OF LOUP CIT	640	TN												
36	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GERING MAINT YARD	1,000	TN					\$ 13.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 6.15	\$ 6,150.00				
37	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL BRIDGPORT YARD	1,000	TN					\$ 15.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 10,250.00				
38	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CHAPPELL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN					\$ 16.00	\$ 32,000.00	\$ 14.95	\$ 29,900.00				
39	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL KIMBALL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN					\$ 11.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 23,000.00				
40	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL SIDNEY MAINT YARD	2,000	TN					\$ 15.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 17.25	\$ 34,500.00				
41	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY20 MP 25 10MI W OF CRAWFORD	2,000	TN					\$ 33.00	\$ 66,000.00	\$ 26.23	\$ 52,460.00				
42	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISON YARD	3,000	TN					\$ 33.00	\$ 99,000.00	\$ 21.70	\$ 65,100.00				
43	DIST 5 ARMOR COATGRAVEL HWY29 MP59 9MI S OF HARRISON	4,000	TN					\$ 33.00	\$ 132,000.00	\$ 20.60	\$ 82,400.00				
44	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL	2,000	TN					\$ 23.00	\$ 46,000.00	\$ 17.16	\$ 34,320.00				
45	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY250 MP39 9MI S OF RUSHVILLE	2,000	TN					\$ 33.00	\$ 66,000.00	\$ 31.18	\$ 62,360.00				
46	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF SCOTTSBLU	3,000	TN					\$ 19.00	\$ 57,000.00	\$ 15.75	\$ 47,250.00				
47	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP41 JCT26 AND L62A	2,000	TN					\$ 21.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 14.57	\$ 29,140.00				
48	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY88 MP17 13MI S OF GERING	3,000	TN					\$ 17.00	\$ 51,000.00	\$ 14.06	\$ 42,180.00				
49	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY	2,000	TN					\$ 17.00	\$ 34,000.00	\$ 22.75	\$ 45,500.00				
50	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISBURG YARD	2,000	TN					\$ 17.00	\$ 34,000.00	\$ 14.72	\$ 29,440.00				
51	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL	4,000	TN					\$ 20.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 16.95	\$ 67,800.00				
52	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY87 MP16 16 MI N OF ALLIANCE	4,000	TN					\$ 24.00	\$ 96,000.00	\$ 23.08	\$ 92,320.00				
53	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP9 12MI NW OF NORTH PLA	2,000	TN					\$ 10.92	\$ 21,840.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 22,000.00				

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Overton Sand & Gravel Co.		Paulsen Inc		Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc		Simon		STALP GRAVEL, INC.		Triple G Redimix LLC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
54	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 23 MP 56 DICKENS	2,000	TN			\$ 10.96	\$ 21,920.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 24,000.00						
55	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS	2,500	TN			\$ 11.26	\$ 28,150.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 27,375.00				
56	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 10.98	\$ 10,980.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 13,000.00						
57	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 10.98	\$ 10,980.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 12,000.00						
58	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 10.74	\$ 10,740.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 16.24	\$ 16,240.00				
59	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	750	TN	\$ 10.99	\$ 8,242.50	\$ 14.34	\$ 10,755.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 20,250.00						
60	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	500	TN	\$ 14.85	\$ 7,425.00	\$ 17.60	\$ 8,800.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 15,000.00						
61	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY MAINT YARD	1,500	TN	\$ 11.18	\$ 16,770.00	\$ 13.26	\$ 19,890.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 40,500.00						
62	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SARGENT YARD	750	TN	\$ 14.75	\$ 11,062.50	\$ 11.10	\$ 8,325.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 20,250.00						
63	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO MAINT YARD	1,500	TN	\$ 11.00	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 11.12	\$ 16,680.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 37,500.00						
64	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OCONTO JCT HWY 21 AND 40	7,500	TN	\$ 10.50	\$ 78,750.00	\$ 13.64	\$ 102,300.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 180,000.00						
65	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	375	TN	\$ 14.00	\$ 5,250.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 5,062.50	\$ 21.00	\$ 7,875.00						
66	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	1,500	TN	\$ 14.40	\$ 21,600.00	\$ 13.75	\$ 20,625.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 33,000.00						
67	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257	750	TN	\$ 14.00	\$ 10,500.00	\$ 11.75	\$ 8,812.50	\$ 26.00	\$ 19,500.00						
68	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68	750	TN	\$ 10.79	\$ 8,092.50	\$ 10.75	\$ 8,062.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 18,000.00						
69	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	1,500	TN	\$ 10.75	\$ 16,125.00	\$ 10.48	\$ 15,720.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 37,500.00						
70	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	500	TN	\$ 14.10	\$ 7,050.00	\$ 13.99	\$ 6,995.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 13,500.00						
71	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 AT DUNNING	750	TN			\$ 14.34	\$ 10,755.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 20,250.00					\$ 11.65	\$ 8,737.50
72	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ROSCOE HWY30 MP136	2,500	TN			\$ 10.46	\$ 26,150.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 13.25	\$ 33,125.00				
73	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OGALLALA HWY26 MP136	2,500	TN			\$ 12.50	\$ 31,250.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 13.25	\$ 33,125.00				
74	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS	5,000	TN			\$ 17.40	\$ 87,000.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 16.40	\$ 82,000.00				
75	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 30 AT OVERTON	1,500	TN	\$ 10.46	\$ 15,690.00	\$ 14.03	\$ 21,045.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 34,500.00						
76	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,500	TN			\$ 22.52	\$ 56,300.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 52,500.00					\$ 11.97	\$ 29,925.00
77	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,000	TN			\$ 27.02	\$ 54,040.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 46,000.00					\$ 15.47	\$ 30,940.00
78	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	500	TN			\$ 23.52	\$ 11,760.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 11,000.00					\$ 11.97	\$ 5,985.00
79	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	2,000	TN			\$ 13.98	\$ 27,960.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 40,000.00					\$ 16.33	\$ 32,660.00
80	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	1,500	TN			\$ 19.46	\$ 29,190.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 34,500.00					\$ 19.83	\$ 29,745.00

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Overton Sand & Gravel Co.		Paulsen Inc		Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc		Simon		STALP GRAVEL, INC.		Triple G Redimix LLC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
81	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS	1,000	TN			\$ 20.54	\$ 20,540.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 23.12	\$ 23,120.00			\$ 16.16	\$ 16,160.00
82	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON	1,000	TN			\$ 16.79	\$ 16,790.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20,000.00					\$ 11.97	\$ 11,970.00
83	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON	1,500	TN			\$ 20.72	\$ 31,080.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 34,500.00					\$ 13.99	\$ 20,985.00
84	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	500	TN			\$ 13.64	\$ 6,820.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10,000.00					\$ 13.20	\$ 6,600.00
85	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	1,500	TN			\$ 19.10	\$ 28,650.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 34,500.00					\$ 16.29	\$ 24,435.00
86	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN	1,000	TN			\$ 24.14	\$ 24,140.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23,000.00					\$ 13.00	\$ 13,000.00
87	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN			\$ 14.39	\$ 14,390.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 16.78	\$ 16,780.00				
88	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR	1,000	TN			\$ 15.90	\$ 15,900.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 18.58	\$ 18,580.00				
89	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN			\$ 15.29	\$ 15,290.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 17.86	\$ 17,860.00				
90	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL THEDFORD YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 25.04	\$ 25,040.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 27,000.00					\$ 12.50	\$ 12,500.00
91	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY	1,000	TN			\$ 27.74	\$ 27,740.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 30,000.00					\$ 14.00	\$ 14,000.00
92	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL	1,000	TN			\$ 19.36	\$ 19,360.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 23.28	\$ 23,280.00				
93	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN	850	TN			\$ 21.16	\$ 17,986.00			\$ 25.25	\$ 21,462.50				
94	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP58 9MI S OF GRANT	2,200	TN			\$ 17.25	\$ 37,950.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 41,800.00	\$ 18.76	\$ 41,272.00				
95	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY23 MP14 5MI W OF GRANT	600	TN			\$ 16.25	\$ 9,750.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10,800.00	\$ 18.14	\$ 10,884.00				
96	DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS	680	TN	\$ 10.49	\$ 7,133.20										
97	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	800	TN											\$ 18.33	\$ 14,664.00
98	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL AINSWORTH YARD	1,500	TN												
99	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL VALENTINE YARD	2,000	TN											\$ 13.58	\$ 27,160.00
100	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL CODY YARD	500	TN											\$ 19.84	\$ 9,920.00
101	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL MERRIMAN YARD	2,000	TN											\$ 22.55	\$ 45,100.00
102	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL NAPER YARD	500	TN												
103	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPENCER YARD	500	TN												
104	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BURWELL SOUTH YARD	1,000	TN												
105	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BARTLETT YARD	1,000	TN												
106	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL TAYLOR YARD	2,000	TN												

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Overton Sand & Gravel Co.		Paulsen Inc		Pine Bluffs Gravel &Exc Inc		Simon		STALP GRAVEL, INC.		Triple G Redimix LLC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
107	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL ONEILL YARD	500	TN												
108	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	1,000	TN											\$ 21.83	\$ 21,830.00
109	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER	2,000	TN												
110	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON	500	TN												
111	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281	1,500	TN												
112	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A	4,000	TN												
113	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP36	3,500	TN												
114	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP43	2,500	TN												
115	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG	600	TN												
116	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN	1,200	TN											\$ 22.55	\$ 27,060.00
117	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY	600	TN											\$ 19.84	\$ 11,904.00
118	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS	600	TN											\$ 16.98	\$ 10,188.00
119	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE	1,200	TN											\$ 13.48	\$ 16,176.00
120	OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	.15/ton mile	\$ 30.00					.18 per ton mile	\$ 36.00	.20/ton/mile	\$ 40.00	\$ 0.20	\$ 40.00
121	OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	.15/ton mile	\$ 30.00					.18 per ton mile	\$ 36.00			\$ 0.20	\$ 40.00
122	OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	.15/ton mile	\$ 30.00					.18 per ton mile	\$ 36.00			\$ 0.20	\$ 40.00
123	OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	.15/ton mile	\$ 30.00									\$ 0.20	\$ 40.00
124	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS	5,000	TN									\$ 18.00	\$ 90,000.00		
Total				\$ 172.26	\$ 230,310.70	\$ 683.66	\$ 1,003,513.50	\$ 1,241.00	\$ 2,169,225.00	\$531.25	\$ 1,119,281.50	\$ 51.20	\$ 124,540.00	\$ 368.11	\$ 441,804.50
Payment Terms				0-30								100-90		0-30	
Delivery Days ARO				30				60		Per ITB		30		60	
Comments															

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			AWARD		AWARD	
				Ulrich Gravel Inc.		WesTeRN MATeRiALs INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL GREENWOOD YARD	715	TN				
2	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY S12D DWIGHT	1,500	TN				
3	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY JCT 79 AND 34	2,250	TN				
4	DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL HWY JCT 8 AND 65	500	TN				
5	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP 88 6MI E OF MONROE	2,500	TN				
6	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 121 AND 32 8MI W OF MADISON	2,500	TN				
7	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 51 AND 77	1,500	TN				
8	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL JCT 32 AND 275	500	TN				
9	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL FULLERTON MAINT YARD	500	TN				
10	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ORD MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$9.98 Tn	\$ 4,990.00		
11	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL GREELEY YARD	300	TN	\$12.98 Tn	\$ 3,894.00		
12	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ST PAUL MAINT YARD	1,000	TN	\$10.10 Tn	\$ 10,100.00		
13	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	600	TN	\$12.00 Tn	\$ 7,200.00		
14	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,000	TN				
15	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL JCT81 AND 92 3 MI W OF OSCEOLA	850	TN				
16	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP339 2MI W OF FARWELL	500	TN	\$14.50 Tn	\$ 7,250.00		
17	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP24 9MI W OF SCOTIA	500	TN	\$13.25 Tn	\$ 6,625.00		
18	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	500	TN				
19	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD	600	TN				
20	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD	1,000	TN				
21	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP339 1MI E OF CENTRAL	1,200	TN				
22	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	2,000	TN	\$15.25 Tn	\$ 30,500.00		
23	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	400	TN				
24	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD	1,420	TN				
25	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY39 MP21 1 MI N OF GENOA	2,000	TN				
26	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY14 MP106 7 MI N OF FULLERTO	100	TN				
27	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD	700	TN	\$10.26 Tn	\$ 7,182.00		

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Ulrich Gravel Inc.		WesTeRN MATeRIAls INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
28	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP68 5MI S OF ORD	1,400	TN	\$10.50 Tn	\$ 14,700.00		
29	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP95 1 MI N OF ST PAUL	700	TN	\$10.10 Tn	\$ 7,070.00		
30	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP89 5 MI S OF ST PAUL	700	TN				
31	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	\$12.50 Tn	\$ 15,000.00		
32	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP125 7 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	\$11.37 Tn	\$ 13,644.00		
33	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP129 10 MI N OF GREELEY	1,200	TN	\$11.37 Tn	\$ 13,644.00		
34	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY58 MP29 1 MI N OF ROCKVILLE	1,280	TN	\$11.50 Tn	\$ 14,720.00		
35	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP320 1 MI W OF LOUP CIT	640	TN	\$12.25 Tn	\$ 7,840.00		
36	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GERING MAINT YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 9.03	\$ 9,030.00
37	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL BRIDGPORT YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 14.25	\$ 14,250.00
38	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CHAPPELL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 23.50	\$ 47,000.00
39	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL KIMBALL MAINT YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 16.77	\$ 33,540.00
40	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL SIDNEY MAINT YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 24.11	\$ 48,220.00
41	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY20 MP 25 10MI W OF CRAWFORD	2,000	TN			\$ 27.87	\$ 55,740.00
42	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISON YARD	3,000	TN			\$ 21.56	\$ 64,680.00
43	DIST 5 ARMOR COATGRAVEL HWY29 MP59 9MI S OF HARRISON	4,000	TN			\$ 19.97	\$ 79,880.00
44	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY29 MP36 24MI N OF MITCHELL	2,000	TN			\$ 15.23	\$ 30,460.00
45	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY250 MP39 9MI S OF RUSHVILLE	2,000	TN			\$ 35.54	\$ 71,080.00
46	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY71 MP90 27MI N OF SCOTTSBLU	3,000	TN			\$ 17.40	\$ 52,200.00
47	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP41 JCT26 AND L62A	2,000	TN			\$ 16.89	\$ 33,780.00
48	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY88 MP17 13MI S OF GERING	3,000	TN			\$ 15.23	\$ 45,690.00
49	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY30 MP55 3MI W OF SIDNEY	2,000	TN			\$ 31.03	\$ 62,060.00
50	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HARRISBURG YARD	2,000	TN			\$ 16.22	\$ 32,440.00
51	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY27 MP92 10MI E OF CHAPPELL	4,000	TN			\$ 27.35	\$ 109,400.00
52	DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY87 MP16 16 MI N OF ALLIANCE	4,000	TN			\$ 25.70	\$ 102,800.00
53	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP9 12MI NW OF NORTH PLA	2,000	TN			\$ 12.16	\$ 24,320.00

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Ulrich Gravel Inc.		WesTeRN MATeRIAls INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
54	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 23 MP 56 DICKENS	2,000	TN			\$ 12.05	\$ 24,100.00
55	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS	2,500	TN			\$ 8.75	\$ 21,875.00
56	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 8.75	\$ 8,750.00
57	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 8.75	\$ 8,750.00
58	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD	1,000	TN			\$ 7.55	\$ 7,550.00
59	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	750	TN				
60	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	500	TN				
61	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY MAINT YARD	1,500	TN	\$11.75 Tn	\$ 17,625.00		
62	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SARGENT YARD	750	TN				
63	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO MAINT YARD	1,500	TN				
64	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OCONTO JCT HWY 21AND 40	7,500	TN				
65	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	375	TN			\$ 15.98	\$ 5,992.50
66	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	1,500	TN			\$ 13.98	\$ 20,970.00
67	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257	750	TN				
68	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68	750	TN				
69	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	1,500	TN				
70	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	500	TN				
71	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 AT DUNNING	750	TN				
72	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ROSCOE HWY30 MP136	2,500	TN			\$ 13.64	\$ 34,100.00
73	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OGALLALA HWY26 MP136	2,500	TN			\$ 19.44	\$ 48,600.00
74	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY26 MP141 ESTRADAS	5,000	TN				
75	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 30 AT OVERTON	1,500	TN				
76	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,500	TN				
77	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	2,000	TN				
78	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	500	TN				
79	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	2,000	TN			\$ 13.64	\$ 27,280.00
80	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON	1,500	TN			\$ 16.64	\$ 24,960.00

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Ulrich Gravel Inc.		WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
81	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP144 2MI W HYANNIS	1,000	TN				
82	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON	1,000	TN			\$ 13.69	\$ 13,690.00
83	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY83 MP127 12MI N STAPLETON	1,500	TN			\$ 16.14	\$ 24,210.00
84	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	500	TN			\$ 11.96	\$ 5,980.00
85	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	1,500	TN			\$ 14.96	\$ 22,440.00
86	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN	1,000	TN				
87	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP126 1MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN				
88	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP175 11MI E ARTHUR	1,000	TN				
89	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY61 MP131 7MI N ARTHUR	1,000	TN				
90	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL THEDFORD YARD	1,000	TN				
91	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 227 AT HALSEY	1,000	TN				
92	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWYS15A MP3 4MI W OF IMPERIAL	1,000	TN				
93	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP24 20MI N OF BENKELMAN	850	TN				
94	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY61 MP58 9MI S OF GRANT	2,200	TN				
95	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY23 MP14 5MI W OF GRANT	600	TN				
96	DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY136 MP24 2 MI E OF ORLEANS	680	TN				
97	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	800	TN				
98	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL AINSWORTH YARD	1,500	TN				
99	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL VALENTINE YARD	2,000	TN				
100	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL CODY YARD	500	TN				
101	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL MERRIMAN YARD	2,000	TN				
102	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL NAPER YARD	500	TN				
103	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPENCER YARD	500	TN				
104	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BURWELL SOUTH YARD	1,000	TN	\$10.75 Tn	\$ 10,750.00		
105	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BARTLETT YARD	1,000	TN	\$10.37 Tn	\$ 10,370.00		
106	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL TAYLOR YARD	2,000	TN	\$12.00 Tn	\$ 24,000.00		

Line #	Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel			Ulrich Gravel Inc.		WesTeRN MATeRIALs INC	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
107	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL O'NEILL YARD	500	TN				
108	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	1,000	TN				
109	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY7 MP3 AT BREWSTER	2,000	TN				
110	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY11 MP14 S OF ATKINSON	500	TN				
111	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP148 JCT 70 AND 281	1,500	TN	\$18.00 Tn	\$ 27,000.00		
112	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP142 6MI S OF JCT 70 A	4,000	TN	\$17.00 Tn	\$ 68,000.00		
113	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP36	3,500	TN				
114	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY91 MP43	2,500	TN				
115	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP80 AT BROCKSBURG	600	TN				
116	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP135 1MI W OF MERRIMAN	1,200	TN				
117	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP165 6MI E OF CODY	600	TN				
118	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP19 1MI E OF SPARKS	600	TN				
119	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP202 6MIE OF VALENTINE	1,200	TN				
120	OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00	.22 ton mile	\$ 44.00
121	OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00	.22 ton mile	\$ 44.00
122	OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.15	\$ 30.00	.22 ton mile	\$ 44.00
123	OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200	TN			.22 ton mile	\$ 44.00
124	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY51 MP 23 4 MI N OF LYONS	5,000	TN				
Total				\$ 258.23	\$ 322,194.00	\$ 566.61	\$ 1,215,993.50
Payment Terms						0-30	
Delivery Days ARO				as needed			
Comments							

Award of Bid Tab Revised to correct Western Materials, Inc. Unit Price bids for Lines 122 & 123.